

**ABSTRACT OF BIDS**

**Vegetation Inventory  
SB-FP-18-1819**

**21-Mar-19**

**Sent to Vendors 134, 15 Responding**

Bidders Name	Applied Ecological Services, Inc.	CMT, Inc.	Ecology & Vision, LLC	Christopher Burke Engineering, Inc.	Mad Scientists Associates, Inc.
Address	West Dundee, IL	Aurora, IL	Leland, IL	Rosemont, IL	Westerville, OH
Option 1. 83.3 acres Nelson Lake Marsh	\$4,780.00	NO BID	\$2,380.00	\$8,164.00	\$11,280.00
Option 2. 151 acres Nelson Lake Marsh	\$5,680.00	NO BID	\$2,960.00	\$8,164.00	\$20,950.00
Option 3. 20.8 acres of Russel Fen	\$1,800.00	\$9,372.75	\$1,985.00	\$7,324.00	NO BID
Option 4. 51.8 acres of Helm Woods	\$2,800.00	NO BID	\$2,295.00	\$7,324.00	NO BID
Option 5. 40 acres Helm Woods	\$1,565.00	NO BID	\$1,905.00	\$7,324.00	NO BID
Option 6. 20.3 acres of Helm Woods	\$1,375.00	\$8,654.83	\$2,295.00	\$7,324.00	NO BID
Option 7. 5.4 acres of LeRoy Oakes	\$1,400.00	\$5,310.40	\$1,670.00	\$4,290.00	NO BID
Option 8. 20.2 acres of Brunner Family	\$2,100.00	\$8,718.91	\$1,985.00	\$7,324.00	NO BID
Option 9. 37.5 acres of Fox River Shores	\$2,775.00	NO BID	\$2,860.00	\$7,324.00	NO BID
Option 10. 28 acres of Freeman Kame	\$2,350.00	NO BID	\$1,850.00	\$7,324.00	NO BID
Option 11. 111.5 acres of Freeman Kame	\$6,300.00	NO BID	\$2,570.00	\$13,080.00	\$20,480.00

**ABSTRACT OF BIDS**

**Vegetation Inventory  
SB-FP-18-1819**

**10.11.18**

**Sent to Vendors 134, 15 Responding**

<b>Bidders NameE5:E5:K13</b>	<b>Encap, Inc.</b>	<b>Orbis Environmental Consulting, Inc.</b>	<b>McConnell Environmental</b>	<b>Conservation Design Forum</b>	<b>Tallgrass Restoration LLC</b>
<b>Address</b>	<b>DeKalb, IL</b>	<b>South Bend, IN</b>	<b>Wonderlake, IL</b>	<b>Lombard, IL</b>	<b>Schaumburg, IL</b>
<b>Option 1. 83.3 acres Nelson Lake Marsh</b>	<b>\$4,500.00</b>	<b>\$21,448.00</b>	<b>\$6,000.00</b>	<b>\$11,000.00</b>	<b>NO BID</b>
<b>Option 2. 151 acres Nelson Lake Marsh</b>	<b>\$4,500.00</b>	<b>\$27,524.00</b>	<b>\$6,000.00</b>	<b>\$12,000.00</b>	<b>NO BID</b>
<b>Option 3. 20.8 acres of Russel Fen</b>	<b>\$3,000.00</b>	<b>\$8,287.00</b>	<b>\$4,500.00</b>	<b>\$7,200.00</b>	<b>\$4,460.00</b>
<b>Option 4. 51.8 acres of Helm Woods</b>	<b>\$4,000.00</b>	<b>\$9,415.00</b>	<b>\$5,000.00</b>	<b>\$9,500.00</b>	<b>\$10,556.00</b>
<b>Option 5. 40 acres Helm Woods</b>	<b>\$4,000.00</b>	<b>\$9,415.00</b>	<b>\$5,000.00</b>	<b>\$9,000.00</b>	<b>\$7,868.00</b>
<b>Option 6. 20.3 acres of Helm Woods</b>	<b>\$3,250.00</b>	<b>\$8,414.00</b>	<b>\$3,500.00</b>	<b>\$7,500.00</b>	<b>\$4,416.00</b>
<b>Option 7. 5.4 acres of LeRoy Oakes</b>	<b>\$2,650.00</b>	<b>\$7,304.00</b>	<b>\$3,500.00</b>	<b>\$5,500.00</b>	<b>\$1,932.00</b>
<b>Option 8. 20.2 acres of Brunner Family</b>	<b>\$3,500.00</b>	<b>\$8,591.00</b>	<b>\$4,500.00</b>	<b>\$8,000.00</b>	<b>\$4,560.00</b>
<b>Option 9. 37.5 acres of Fox River Shores</b>	<b>\$3,950.00</b>	<b>\$14,944.00</b>	<b>\$4,500.00</b>	<b>\$9,500.00</b>	<b>\$8,112.00</b>
<b>Option 10. 28 acres of Freeman Kame</b>	<b>\$3,900.00</b>	<b>\$11,775.00</b>	<b>\$4,500.00</b>	<b>\$8,500.00</b>	<b>\$6,372.00</b>
<b>Option 11. 111.5 acres of Freeman Kame</b>	<b>\$7,500.00</b>	<b>\$21,728.00</b>	<b>\$6,000.00</b>	<b>\$11,500.00</b>	<b>NO BID</b>

**ABSTRACT OF BIDS**

**21-Mar-19**

**Vegetation Inventory**

**SB-FP-18-1819**

**Sent to Vendors 134, 15 Responding**

Bidders Name	Huff & Huff, Inc.	Conservationland Stewardship, Inc.	ILM, Inc.	WBK Engineering, Inc.	Heartland Ecological Group, Inc.
Address	Oak Brook, IL	Elmhurst, IL	Waukegan, IL	St. Charles, IL	Mt. Horeb, WI
Option 1. 83.3 acres Nelson Lake Marsh	\$14,700.00	\$29,234.00	\$11,400.00	\$12,951.54	\$4,400.00
Option 2. 151 acres Nelson Lake Marsh	\$16,000.00	\$53,754.00	\$14,250.00	\$18,476.46	\$4,600.00
Option 3. 20.8 acres of Russel Fen	\$13,800.00	\$7,301.00	\$4,500.00	\$8,234.64	\$4,000.00
Option 4. 51.8 acres of Helm Woods	\$14,600.00	\$18,225.00	\$7,980.00	\$9,943.74	\$4,000.00
Option 5. 40 acres Helm Woods	\$12,800.00	\$14,632.00	\$7,410.00	\$12,625.56	\$4,000.00
Option 6. 20.3 acres of Helm Woods	\$13,700.00	\$7,271.00	\$4,500.00	\$9,312.48	\$4,000.00
Option 7. 5.4 acres of LeRoy Oakes	\$7,200.00	\$4,035.50	\$3,800.00	\$6,091.74	\$4,000.00
Option 8. 20.2 acres of Brunner Family	\$13,500.00	\$7,213.50	\$5,700.00	\$9,798.66	\$4,400.00
Option 9. 37.5 acres of Fox River Shores	\$15,100.00	\$13,406.00	\$6,460.00	\$13,216.86	\$4,000.00
Option 10. 28 acres of Freeman Kame	\$9,900.00	\$10,140.48	\$4,800.00	\$10,140.48	\$4,000.00
Option 11. 111.5 acres of Freeman Kame	\$16,400.00	\$16,635.06	\$12,825.00	\$16,635.06	\$4,400.00

**I certify that I have opened, read and recorded herein all bids received in response to the invitation.**

\_\_\_\_\_  
**Kenneth Stanish, Chief Financial Officer**