

**ABSTRACT OF BIDS**

**SB-FP-16-1819**

**Garlic Mustard Management at Four (4) Forest Preserves**

**Sent to 17 Vendors, Received 6**

Bidders Name	TallGrass Restoration, LLC	Semper Fi Land, Inc.	Conservationland Stewardship, Ltd.
Address	Schaumburg, IL	Yorkville, IL	Elmhurst, IL
Option 1. (86 acres) Bliss Woods	\$15,910.00	\$14,250.00	\$18,490.00
Option 2. (88 acres) Johnson's Mound	\$15,840.00	NO BID	\$18,920.00
Option 3. (63 acres) Freeman Kame	\$16,000.00	NO BID	\$18,585.00
Option 4. (9.2 acres) Lone Grove	\$4,167.00	\$2,500.00	\$4,002.00

**Garlic Mustard Management at Four (4) Forest Preserves**

Bidders Name	Encap, Inc.	Precision Prairie Works	
Address	DeKalb, IL	Wonder Lake, IL	
Option 1. (86 acres) Bliss Woods	\$21,414.00	NO BID	
Option 2. (88 acres) Johnson's Mound	\$21,912.00	NO BID	
Option 3. (63 acres) Freeman Kame	\$28,350.00	\$10,100.00	
Option 4. ( 9.2 acres) Lone Grove	\$4,140.00	NO BID	

**I have certified that I have opened, read and recorded all bids received in response to the invitation.**

---

Kenneth Stanish