

ABSTRACT OF BIDS

SB-FP-15-1819

Reed Canary Management for Seven (7) Forest Preserves

Sent to 17 Vendors , 5 Responding

Bidders Name	ConservationLand Stewardship, LLC.	Applied Ecological Services, Inc.	Semper Fi Land, Inc.
Address	Elmhurst, IL	Brodhead, WI	Yorkville, IL
Option 1. (6 acres) Braeburn Marsh	\$2,346.00	\$2,399.00	\$3,250.00
Option 2. (36 acres) Dick Young	\$13,032.00	\$8,637.00	NO BID
Option 3. (18 acres) Fox River Shores	\$6,030.00	\$9,499.00	NO BID
Option 4. (5.2 acres) Lone Grove	\$2,100.00	\$3,693.00	\$3,000.00
Option 5. (12 acres) Schweitzer Woods	\$4,128.00	NO BID	NO BID
Option 6. (23 acres) Bowes Creek	\$7,912.00	\$5,557.00	\$10,600.00
Option 7. (20.5 acres) Meissner-Corron	\$6,858.00	NO BID	NO BID

Reed Canary Management for Seven (7) Forest Preserves

Bidders Name	McGinty Bros., Inc.	Precision Prairie Works
Address	Long Grove, IL	Wonder Lake, IL
Option 1. (6 acres) Braeburn Marsh	\$2,720.00	NO BID
Option 2. (36 acres) Dick Young	\$12,200.00	NO BID
Option 3. (18 acres) Fox River Shores	\$14,550.00	NO BID
Option 4. (5.2 acres) Lone Grove	\$6,800.00	NO BID
Option 5. (12 acres) Schweitzer Woods	\$9,200.00	\$4,400.00
Option 6. (23 acres) Bowes Creek	\$10,350.00	\$9,800.00
Option 7. (20.5 acres) Meissner-Corron	\$14,800.00	NO BID

I have certified that I have opened, read and recorded all bids received in response to the invitation.

Kenneth Stanish