

**ABSTRACT OF BIDS**

<b>Demolition of 5 Sites SB-FP-16-1920</b>	<b>25-Oct-19</b> Sent to 29 Vendors 7 Responded			
<b>Bidders Name</b>	<b>Brad Schramer Trucking</b>	<b>Fowler Enterprises, LLC</b>	<b>Green Demolition Contractors</b>	<b>Omega III, LLC.</b>
<b>Address</b>	<b>Maple Park, IL</b>	<b>Elgin, IL</b>	<b>Chicago, IL</b>	<b>Elgin, IL</b>
<b>Site #1 Holzer, Helm Woods FP Property</b>	<b>no bid</b>	<b>\$41,850.00</b>	<b>\$92,380.00</b>	<b>\$66,525.00</b>
<b>Site #2 Raging Buffalo, Buffalo Park FP Property</b>	<b>no bid</b>	<b>\$38,350.00</b>	<b>\$108,900.00</b>	<b>\$62,100.00</b>
<b>Site #3 Freeman Kame FP Property</b>	<b>no bid</b>	<b>\$45,250.00</b>	<b>\$172,700.00</b>	<b>\$100,380.00</b>
<b>Site #4 Crane Road/Reimer, Ferson Creek FP Property /COMPLETED IN HOUSE</b>	<b>\$38,000.00</b>	<b>\$15,400.00</b>	<b>\$69,600.00</b>	<b>\$38,250.00</b>
<b>Site #5 Gwinn Oaks, Big Rock FP Property/COMPLETED IN HOUSE</b>	<b>\$89,000.00</b>	<b>\$61,400.00</b>	<b>\$181,980.00</b>	<b>\$100,487.00</b>

<b>Bidders Name</b>	<b>Alpine Demolition Services, LLC.</b>	<b>Kendall Excavating</b>	<b>S &amp; S Construction and Granite, LLC</b>	
<b>Address</b>	<b>St. Charles, IL</b>	<b>Yorkville, IL</b>	<b>Zion, IL</b>	
<b>Site #1 Holzer, Helm Woods FP Property</b>	<b>\$79,625.00</b>	<b>no bid</b>	<b>\$58,000.00</b>	
<b>Site #2 Raging Buffalo, Buffalo Park FP Property</b>	<b>\$50,725.00</b>	<b>no bid</b>	<b>\$44,000.00</b>	
<b>Site #3 Freeman Kame FP Property</b>	<b>\$169,400.00</b>	<b>no bid</b>	<b>\$74,000.00</b>	
<b>Site #4 Crane Road/Reimer, Ferson Creek FP Property /COMPLETED IN HOUSE</b>	<b>\$52,250.00</b>	<b>\$16,552.00</b>	<b>\$17,000.00</b>	
<b>Site #5 Gwinn Oaks, Big Rock FP Property/COMPLETED IN HOUSE</b>	<b>\$118,500.00</b>	<b>\$37,490.00</b>	<b>\$65,000.00</b>	

I have certified that I have opened, read and recorded all bids received in response to the invitation.



Kenneth Stanish, Chief Financial Officer