


Agrecol LLC Genesis Nursery, Inc. Millborn Seeds

 Resource Environmental 

Solutions / Taylor Creek 

Restoration Nurseries 

 Spence Restoration 

Nursery 

 Shooting Star 

Natives Seeds 

$24,941.00 $ 15,039.08 $ 61,323.62 $ 14,115.75 25,282.20$                   69,163.60$           

# Items Common Name

Ounces

Required

1 Donhue Seed

#1-1 Agalinis purpurea Purple False Foxglove 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-2 Agalinus tenuifolia Slender False Foxglove 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid 240.00$                                   No Bid No Bid

#1-3 Allium cernuum Nodding Onion 323 No Bid No Bid 4,037.50$                 No Bid No Bid 3,230.00$             

#1-4 Amorpha canescens Lead Plant 160 No Bid No Bid 448.00$                     No Bid 960.00$                         No Bid

#1-5 Andropogon gerardii Big Bluestem 656 492.00$                 No Bid 209.92$                     No Bid 328.00$                         229.60$                

#1-6 Anemone canadensis Canada Anemone 76 1,900.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,052.00$             

#1-7 Anemone cylindrica Thimbleweed 64 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-8 Antennaria neglecta Prairie Pussytoes 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-9 Antennaria plantaginifolia Pussytoes 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-10 Arnoglossum atriplicifolium Pale Indian Plantain 320 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-11 Asclepias incarnata Rose Milkweed 80 No Bid 500.00$                         328.00$                     No Bid 1,500.00$                      736.00$                

#1-12 Asclepias purpurascens Purple Milkweed 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-13 Asclepias sullivantii Prairie Milkweed 64 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4,800.00$                     No Bid

#1-14 Asclepias syriaca Common Milkweed 320 1,600.00$              1,801.60$                      1,600.00$                 No Bid No Bid 1,520.00$             

#1-15 Asclepias tuberosa Butterfly Weed 192 No Bid No Bid 4,147.20$                 No Bid No Bid 5,568.00$             

#1-16 Asclepias verticillata Whorled Milkweed 96 No Bid No Bid No Bid 5,760.00$                                No Bid 3,408.00$             

#1-17 Astragalus canadensis Canada Milk Vetch 112 No Bid 210.56$                         56.00$                       No Bid No Bid 336.00$                

#1-18 Baptisia bracteata Cream Wild Indigo 96 No Bid 4,800.00$                      No Bid 7,680.00$                                No Bid No Bid

#1-19 Baptisia lactea White Wild Indigo 400 No Bid 2,500.00$                      3,400.00$                 No Bid No Bid 3,700.00$             

#1-20 Blephilia ciliata Ohio Horse Mint 2 No Bid No Bid 280.00$                     No Bid No Bid 240.00$                

#1-21 Blephilia hirsuta Hairy Wood Mint 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid 77.00$                                     No Bid No Bid

#1-22 Bouteloua curtipendula Side Oats 4800 No Bid 6,624.00$                      5,040.00$                 14,400.00$                             No Bid 5,280.00$             

#1-23 Brickellia eupatorioides False Boneset 64 No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,240.00$                                No Bid 1,792.00$             

#1-24 Bromus ciliatus Fringed Brome 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-25 Bromus kalmii Prairie Brome 400 No Bid 2,124.00$                      1,500.00$                 No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-26 Calamagrostis canadensis Blue Joint Grass 4 320.00$                 No Bid 250.00$                     316.00$                                   No Bid 248.00$                

#1-27 Caltha palustris Marsh Marigold 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid 75.00$                                     No Bid No Bid

#1-28 Camassia scilloides Wild Hyacinth 70 No Bid No Bid No Bid 3,850.00$                               No Bid No Bid

#1-29 Carex annectens Small Yellow Fox Sedge 16 No Bid No Bid 16.00$                       224.00$                                   148.80$                         No Bid

#1-30 Carex bebbii Bebb's Oval Sedge 6 No Bid No Bid No Bid 90.00$                                     No Bid 144.00$                

#1-31 Carex bicknellii Copper-shouldered Oval Sedge 352 8,800.00$              No Bid 5,508.80$                 5,808.00$                                No Bid 4,576.00$             

#1-32 Carex blanda Common Wood Sedge 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-33 Carex brevior Plains Oval Sedge 336 4,200.00$              No Bid No Bid 3,696.00$                               No Bid No Bid

#1-34 Carex cephalophora Short-headed Bracted Sedge 32 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-35 Carex cristatella Crested Sedge 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-36 Carex diandra Bog Panicled Sedge 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-37 Carex granularis Pale Sedge 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid 512.00$                                   No Bid 296.00$                



#1-38 Carex gravida Long-awned Bracted Sedge 32 No Bid No Bid 428.80$                     No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-39 Carex lacustris Lake Sedge 16 No Bid No Bid 848.00$                     No Bid No Bid 696.00$                

#1-40 Carex lasiocarpa Narrow Woolly Sedge 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-41 Carex meadii Mead's Stiff Sedge 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-42 Carex molesta Field Oval Sedge 32 No Bid No Bid 131.20$                     No Bid No Bid 240.00$                

#1-43 Carex molesta Field Oval Sedge 6 No Bid No Bid 24.60$                       84.00$                                     No Bid 45.00$                   

#1-44 Carex normalis Spreading Oval Sedge 6 No Bid No Bid No Bid 99.00$                                     No Bid 210.00$                

#1-45 Carex pellita Prairie Woolly Sedge 32 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-46 Carex sartwellii Running Prairie Sedge 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-47 Carex scoparia Lance-fruited Oval Sedge 8 No Bid No Bid 122.40$                     80.00$                                     No Bid 160.00$                

#1-48 Carex stricta Tussock Sedge 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 896.00$                

#1-49 Carex tribuloides Blunt Broom Sedge 6 150.00$                 No Bid 36.00$                       204.00$                                   No Bid No Bid

#1-50 Ceanothus americanus New Jersey Tea 32 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-51 Chamaecrista fasciculata Partridge Pea 1200 No Bid No Bid 720.00$                     No Bid No Bid 660.00$                

#1-52 Chelone glabra Turtlehead 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 372.00$                

#1-53 Cicuta maculata Water Hemlock 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid 32.00$                                     No Bid No Bid

#1-54 Cirsium discolor Pasture Thistle 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 768.00$                

#1-55 Cirsium muticum Swamp Thistle 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-56 Comandra umbellata False Toadflax 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-57 Coreopsis lanceolata Lance-Leaf Coreopsis 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 44.00$                           9.60$                     

#1-58 Coreopsis palmata Prairie Coreopsis 160 10,000.00$            No Bid 10,000.00$               No Bid 7,040.00$                     7,200.00$             

#1-59 Coreopsis tripteris Tall Coreopsis 48 No Bid No Bid 1,051.20$                 No Bid 595.20$                         No Bid

#1-60 Cyperus schweinitzii Rough Sand Sedge 32 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-61 Dalea candida White Prairie Clover 160 No Bid 300.80$                         96.00$                       No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-62 Dalea purpurea Purple Prairie Clover 320 No Bid 499.20$                         160.00$                     No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-63 Danthonia spicata Poverty Oat Grass 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-64 Desmodium canadense Showy Tick Trefoil 64 640.00$                 240.00$                         144.00$                     No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-65 Desmodium illinoensis Illinois Tick Trefoil 160 No Bid No Bid 512.00$                     No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-66 Dodecatheon meadia Midland Shooting Star 32 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3,808.00$             

#1-67 Doellingeria umbellata Flat-top Aster 6 No Bid No Bid 150.00$                     No Bid 78.00$                           No Bid

#1-68 Drymocallis arguta Prairie Cinquefoil 48 240.00$                 No Bid 240.00$                     No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-69 Echinacea pallida Pale Purple Coneflower 1120 No Bid 2,800.00$                      1,400.00$                 No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-70 Eleocharis acicularis Needle Spike Rush 6 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 60.00$                   

#1-71 Eleocharis compressa Flatstem Spike Rush 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-72 Elymus canadensis Canada Wild Rye 1600 5,000.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,200.00$                      1,760.00$             

#1-73 Epilobium coloratum Cinnamon Willow Herb 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid 60.00$                                     No Bid No Bid

#1-74 Eragrostis spectabilis Purple Love Grass 32 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-75 Eryngium yuccifolium Rattlesnake Master 400 No Bid 4,624.00$                      1,640.00$                 6,000.00$                                No Bid No Bid

#1-76 Eupatorium perfoliatum Boneset 2 No Bid No Bid 50.00$                       64.00$                                     No Bid 56.00$                   

#1-77 Euphorbia corollata Flowering Spurge 64 No Bid 2,600.32$                      No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-78 Euthamia graminifolia Grass-leaved Goldenrod 16 1,000.00$              No Bid 1,000.00$                 No Bid 960.00$                         768.00$                

#1-79 Euthamia gymnospermoides Plains Grass-leaved Goldenrod 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-80 Eutrochium maculatum Joe Pye Weed 4 80.00$                    No Bid 75.00$                       96.00$                                     115.00$                         75.00$                   

#1-81 Galium boreale Northern Bedstraw 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 392.00$                

#1-82 Gaura biennis Biennial Gaura 128 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



#1-83 Gentiana andrewsii Bottle Gentain 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-84 Gentianella quinquefolia Stiff Gentian 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-85 Geum triflorum Prairie Smoke 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,000.00$             

#1-86 Glyceria striata Fowl Manna Grass 8 No Bid No Bid 56.00$                       152.00$                                   No Bid No Bid

#1-87 Helenium autumnale Sneezeweed 4 No Bid No Bid 28.00$                       72.00$                                     No Bid No Bid

#1-88 Helianthus grosseserratus Saw-tooth Sunflower 16 No Bid 600.00$                         160.00$                     672.00$                                   No Bid 280.00$                

#1-89 Helianthus mollis Downy Sunflower 80 No Bid No Bid 2,000.00$                 No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-90 Helianthus occidentalis Western Sunflower 32 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-91 Helianthus pauciflorus Prairie Sunflower 64 3,200.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-92 Heliopsis helianthoides Early Sunflower 272 952.00$                 340.00$                         231.20$                     544.00$                                   2,720.00$                      No Bid

#1-93 Hesperostipa spartea Porcupine Grass 96 3,000.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,056.00$             

#1-94 Heuchera richardsonii Prairie Alumroot 7 630.00$                 No Bid 455.00$                     735.00$                                   No Bid No Bid

#1-95 Hypericum punctatum Dotted St. John's Wort 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-96 Hypericum sphaerocarpum Round-fruited  St. John’s Wort 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-97 Iris virginica shrevei Blue Flag Iris 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-98 Juncus dudleyi Dudley's Rush 1 60.00$                    No Bid No Bid 35.00$                                     No Bid 37.00$                   

#1-99 Juncus effusus Common Rush 1 20.00$                    No Bid No Bid 25.00$                                     No Bid 18.75$                   

#1-100 Juncus nodosus Knotted Rush 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 24.00$                   

#1-101 Juncus torreyi Torrey's Rush 1 50.00$                    No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-102 Koeleria macrantha June Grass 80 1,200.00$              No Bid 1,000.00$                 1,360.00$                                No Bid 900.00$                

#1-103 Lespedeza capitata Round-headed  Bush Clover 272 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5,712.00$                     No Bid

#1-104 Liatris aspera Button Blazing Star 160 6,400.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-105 Liatris cylindracea Dwarf Blazing Star 64 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-106 Liatris pycnostachya Prairie Blazing Star 80 1,200.00$              No Bid 1,224.00$                 1,800.00$                                No Bid 980.00$                

#1-107 Lilium michiganense Michigan Lily 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 496.00$                

#1-108 Lilium philadelphicum Prairie Lily 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-109 Lithospermum canescens Hoary Puccoon 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-110 Lobelia cardinalis Cardinal Flower 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid 56.25$                                     No Bid 70.00$                   

#1-111 Lobelia siphilitica Great Blue Lobelia 4 200.00$                 No Bid 75.00$                       144.00$                                   No Bid 120.00$                

#1-112 Lobelia spicata Pale Spiked Lobelia 4.5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-113 Lolium multiflorum Annual Rye Grass 28800 No Bid No Bid 1,440.00$                 No Bid No Bid 2,880.00$             

#1-114 Lycopus americanus American Bugleweed 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.50$                           No Bid

#1-115 Lycopus uniflorus Bugleweed 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-116 Lysimachia quadriflora Fen Loosestrife 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-117 Lythrum alatum Winged Loosestrife 0.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 22.50$                                     No Bid No Bid

#1-118 Maianthemum stellatum Starry False Solomon's Seal 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-119 Mentha canadensis Wild Mint 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-120 Mimulus ringens Monkey Flower 0.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-121 Monarda fistulosa Wild Bergamot 86 No Bid 430.00$                         348.30$                     1,075.00$                                2,150.00$                      1,032.00$             

#1-122 Oenothera pilosella Prairie Sundrops 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 188.00$                         No Bid

#1-123 Oligoneuron albidum Upland White Goldenrod 48 No Bid No Bid No Bid 480.00$                                   No Bid No Bid

#1-124 Oligoneuron ohioense Ohio Goldenrod 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid 88.00$                                     50.00$                           80.00$                   

#1-125 Oligoneuron riddellii Riddell’s Goldenrod 4 No Bid No Bid 83.60$                       120.00$                                   144.00$                         No Bid

#1-126 Oligoneuron rigidum Stiff Goldenrod 4 40.00$                    18.76$                           No Bid 48.00$                                     50.00$                           19.00$                   

#1-127 Oxalis violacea Violet Wood Sorrel 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-128 Oxypolis rigidior Cowbane 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



#1-129 Packera plattensis Prairie Ragwort 2 No Bid No Bid 450.00$                     No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-130 Panicum oligosanthes Scribner's Panic Grass 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-131 Panicum virgatum Switch Grass 304 No Bid 191.52$                         197.60$                     No Bid 152.00$                         182.40$                

#1-132 Parthenium integrifolium Wild Quinine 192 No Bid 2,160.00$                      No Bid No Bid 3,072.00$                      No Bid

#1-133 Pedicularis canadensis Wood Betony 64 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-134 Pedicularis lanceolata Marsh Betony 6 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-135 Penstemon digitalis Foxglove Beardtongue 32 480.00$                 144.00$                         131.20$                     288.00$                                   192.00$                         176.00$                

#1-136 Penstemon hirsutus Hairy Beardtounge 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid 54.00$                                     57.00$                           52.50$                   

#1-137 Phlox glaberrima var. interior Marsh Phlox 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-138 Phlox pilosa Prairie Phlox 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-139 Physostegia virginiana Obedient Plant 8 No Bid No Bid 125.20$                     No Bid 150.00$                         110.00$                

#1-140 Poa palustris Fowl Bluegrass 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-141 Polygala senega Seneca Snakeroot 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-142 Polytaenia nuttallii Prairie Parsley 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-143 Prenanthes racemosa Smooth Prairie Lettuce 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-144 Pseudognaphalium obtusifolium Sweet Everlasting 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-145 Pycnanthemum virginianum Mountain Mint 18 540.00$                 337.50$                         394.20$                     540.00$                                   810.00$                         306.00$                

#1-146 Ranunculus scleratus Annual Buttercup 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-147 Ratibida pinnata Yellow Coneflower 176 No Bid No Bid 246.40$                     660.00$                                   660.00$                         528.00$                

#1-148 Rosa blanda Early Wild Rose 8 600.00$                 No Bid 200.00$                     No Bid No Bid 160.00$                

#1-149 Rosa carolina Pasture Rose 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-150 Rosa palustris Swamp Rose 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 31.00$                   

#1-151 Rudbeckia hirta Black-eyed Susan 160 No Bid 150.40$                         96.00$                       320.00$                                   No Bid No Bid

#1-152 Rudbeckia subtomentosa Sweet Black-eyed Susan 32 160.00$                 No Bid 160.00$                     512.00$                                   179.20$                         160.00$                

#1-153 Rudbeckia triloba Brown-eyed Susan 80 No Bid 200.00$                         120.00$                     880.00$                                   No Bid No Bid

#1-154 Ruellia humilis Wild Petunia 16 400.00$                 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-155 Schizachyrium scoparium Little Bluestem 2400 3,750.00$              No Bid No Bid 3,600.00$                                4,200.00$                      2,040.00$             

#1-156 Schoenoplectus acutus Hard-Stemmed Bulrush 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid 400.00$                                   No Bid 344.00$                

#1-157 Scirpus atrovirens Dark-green Bulrush 1 3.00$                      No Bid No Bid 3.75$                                        8.75$                              6.00$                     

#1-158 Scirpus cyperinus Wool Grass 0.5 No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.50$                                        7.50$                              3.75$                     

#1-159 Scutellaria lateriflora Mad-Dog Skullcap 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-160 Silene regia Royal Catchfly 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid 336.00$                                   No Bid No Bid

#1-161 Silphium integrifolium Rosin Weed 320 No Bid No Bid 2,592.00$                 No Bid 3,299.20$                      8,960.00$             

#1-162 Silphium laciniatum Compass Plant 480 3,600.00$              6,000.00$                      4,800.00$                 No Bid 13,440.00$                   No Bid

#1-163 Silphium terebinthinaceum Prairie Dock 400 3,000.00$              8,752.00$                      7,120.00$                 No Bid No Bid 2,700.00$             

#1-164 Sisyrinchium albidum Common Blue-Eyed Grass 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-165 Sium suave Tall Water Parsnip 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 184.00$                

#1-166 Solidago gigantea Late Goldenrod 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 93.60$                           No Bid

#1-167 Solidago juncea Early Goldenrod 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid 240.00$                                   168.00$                         216.00$                

#1-168 Solidago nemoralis Old Field Goldenrod 16 No Bid No Bid 180.00$                     288.00$                                   No Bid No Bid

#1-169 Solidago speciosa Showy Goldenrod 16 960.00$                 No Bid 214.40$                     No Bid 704.00$                         384.00$                

#1-170 Sorghastrum nutans Indian Grass 480 480.00$                 No Bid 264.00$                     240.00$                                   264.00$                         192.00$                

#1-171 Spartina pectinata Cord Grass 64 No Bid No Bid No Bid 768.00$                                   1,024.00$                      No Bid

#1-172 Sporobolus cryptandrus Sand Dropseed 80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-173 Sporobolus heterolepsis Prairie Dropseed 800 12,000.00$            No Bid 7,280.00$                 No Bid No Bid 7,400.00$             

#1-174 Symphyotrichum ericoides Heath Aster 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 488.00$                         No Bid



#1-175 Symphyotrichum laeve Smooth Blue Aster 48 No Bid No Bid 451.20$                     900.00$                                   528.00$                         444.00$                

#1-176 Symphyotrichum lanceolatum Panicled Aster 2 100.00$                 No Bid No Bid 88.00$                                     56.00$                           80.00$                   

#1-177 Symphyotrichum novae-angliae New England Aster 44 440.00$                 No Bid 752.40$                     1,650.00$                                880.00$                         495.00$                

#1-178 Symphyotrichum oblongifolium Aromatic Aster 32 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-179 Symphyotrichum oolentangiense Sky Blue Aster 32 No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,200.00$                                400.00$                         No Bid

#1-180 Symphyotrichum puniceum Bristly Aster 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid 220.00$                                   No Bid 192.00$                

#1-181 Symphyotrichum sericeum Silky Aster 32 No Bid No Bid 960.00$                     No Bid No Bid 1,920.00$             

#1-182 Symphyptrichium lateriflorum Calico Aster 11 No Bid No Bid No Bid 770.00$                                   No Bid 495.00$                

#1-183 Taenidia integerrima Yellow Pimpernel 30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-184 Thalictrum dasycarpum Purple Meadow Rue 32 No Bid 800.00$                         No Bid 704.00$                                   No Bid No Bid

#1-185 Tradescantia ohiensis Ohio Spiderwort 352 No Bid No Bid 5,508.80$                 7,920.00$                                No Bid 4,752.00$             

#1-186 Verbena hastata Blue Vervain 6 No Bid No Bid 36.00$                       33.78$                                     72.00$                           27.00$                   

#1-187 Verbena simplex Narrow-leaved Vervain 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-188 Verbena stricta Hoary Vervain 16 96.00$                    90.08$                            70.40$                       120.00$                                   No Bid 88.00$                   

#1-189 Vernonia fasciculata Common Ironweed 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.00$                                     9.30$                             No Bid

#1-190 Vernonia missurica Missouri Ironweed 48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-191 Veronicastrum virginicum Culver’s Root 4 128.00$                 No Bid 150.00$                     300.00$                                   248.00$                         192.00$                

#1-192 Viola pedatifida Prairie Violet 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-193 Viola sororia Common Blue Violet 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-194 Zizia aptera Heart-leaved Golden Alexanders 80 No Bid No Bid 1,072.00$                 No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-195 Zizia aurea Golden Alexanders 192 624.00$                 480.00$                         422.40$                     No Bid 960.00$                         1,440.00$             

2 Johnson's Mound Seed

#2-1 Allium cernuum Nodding Onion 192 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3,456.00$                      1,920.00$             

#2-2 Amorpha canescens Lead Plant 128 No Bid No Bid 358.40$                     No Bid 768.00$                         No Bid

#2-3 Andropogon gerardii Big Bluestem 320 240.00$                 No Bid 102.40$                     No Bid 160.00$                         112.00$                

#2-4 Anemone canadensis Canada Anemone 48 1,200.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,296.00$             

#2-5 Anemone virginiana Tall Thimbleweed 32 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,696.00$             

#2-6 Antennaria plantaginifolia Pussytoes 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#2-7 Arnoglossum atriplicifolium Pale Indian Plantain 96 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#2-8 Arnoglossum plantagineum Prairie Indian Plantain 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#2-9 Asclepias incarnata Rose Milkweed 96 No Bid 600.00$                         393.60$                     No Bid 1,800.00$                      883.20$                

#2-10 Asclepias sullivantii Prairie Milkweed 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,200.00$                     No Bid

#2-11 Asclepias syriaca Common Milkweed 192 960.00$                 1,080.96$                      960.00$                     No Bid 3,072.00$                      912.00$                

#2-12 Asclepias tuberosa Butterfly Weed 48 No Bid No Bid 1,036.80$                 No Bid No Bid 1,392.00$             

#2-13 Asclepias verticillata Whorled Milkweed 48 No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,880.00$                                No Bid 1,704.00$             

#2-14 Astragalus canadensis Canada Milk Vetch 64 No Bid 120.32$                         32.00$                       No Bid No Bid 192.00$                

#2-15 Baptisia bracteata Cream Wild Indigo 16 No Bid 800.00$                         No Bid 1,280.00$                                No Bid No Bid

#2-16 Baptisia lactea White Wild Indigo 384 No Bid No Bid 3,264.00$                 No Bid No Bid 3,552.00$             

#2-17 Blephilia ciliata Ohio Horse Mint 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 240.00$                

#2-18 Bouteloua curtipendula Side Oats 1920 No Bid No Bid 2,016.00$                 5,760.00$                                No Bid 2,112.00$             

#2-19 Brickellia eupatorioides False Boneset 32 No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,120.00$                                No Bid 896.00$                

#2-20 Bromus kalmii Prairie Brome 800 No Bid No Bid 3,000.00$                 No Bid No Bid No Bid

#2-21 Camassia scilloides Wild Hyacinth 32 No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,760.00$                               No Bid No Bid

#2-22 Carex bebbii Bebb's Oval Sedge 32 No Bid No Bid No Bid 480.00$                                   No Bid 768.00$                

#2-23 Carex bicknellii Copper-shouldered Oval Sedge 96 2,400.00$              No Bid 1,502.40$                 1,584.00$                                No Bid 1,248.00$             



#2-24 Carex blanda Common Wood Sedge 96 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#2-25 Carex brevior Plains Oval Sedge 96 1,200.00$              No Bid No Bid 1,056.00$                               No Bid No Bid

#2-26 Carex cristatella Crested Sedge 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#2-27 Carex molesta Field Oval Sedge 96 No Bid No Bid 393.60$                     1,344.00$                                No Bid 720.00$                

#2-28 Chamaecrista fasciculata Partridge Pea 640 No Bid 403.20$                         384.00$                     No Bid No Bid 352.00$                

#2-29 Cirsium discolor Pasture Thistle 32 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,536.00$             

#2-30 Coreopsis palmata Prairie Coreopsis 48 No Bid No Bid 3,000.00$                 No Bid 2,112.00$                     2,160.00$             

#2-31 Dalea candida White Prairie Clover 96 No Bid 180.48$                         57.60$                       No Bid No Bid No Bid

#2-32 Dalea purpurea Purple Prairie Clover 144 No Bid 224.64$                         72.00$                       No Bid 1,008.00$                      No Bid

#2-33 Desmodium illinoensis Illinois Tick Trefoil 48 No Bid No Bid 153.60$                     No Bid No Bid No Bid

#2-34 Dodecatheon meadia Midland Shooting Star 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,904.00$             

#2-35 Echinacea pallida Pale Purple Coneflower 480 No Bid No Bid 600.00$                     2,880.00$                                No Bid No Bid

#2-36 Elymus canadensis Canada Wild Rye 1120 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,540.00$                      1,232.00$             

#2-37 Eupatorium perfoliatum Boneset 2 No Bid No Bid 50.00$                       64.00$                                     56.00$                           56.00$                   

#2-38 Euphorbia corollata Flowering Spurge 48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#2-39 Euthamia graminifolia Grass-leaved Goldenrod 6 No Bid No Bid 375.00$                     No Bid 360.00$                         288.00$                

#2-40 Galium boreale Northern Bedstraw 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 392.00$                

#2-41 Gentianella quinquefolia Stiff Gentian 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#2-42 Helenium autumnale Sneezeweed 4 No Bid No Bid 28.00$                       704.00$                                   No Bid No Bid

#2-43 Helianthus grosseserratus Saw-tooth Sunflower 32 No Bid No Bid 320.00$                     7,680.00$                                1,216.00$                      560.00$                

#2-44 Helianthus mollis Downy Sunflower 64 No Bid No Bid 1,600.00$                 No Bid No Bid No Bid

#2-45 Helianthus pauciflorus Prairie Sunflower 32 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#2-46 Heliopsis helianthoides Early Sunflower 384 1,344.00$              480.00$                         326.40$                     768.00$                                   3,840.00$                      No Bid

#2-47 Heuchera richardsonii Prairie Alumroot 2 180.00$                 No Bid 130.00$                     210.00$                                   No Bid No Bid

#2-48 Juncus dudleyi Dudley's Rush 1 60.00$                    No Bid No Bid 35.00$                                     No Bid 37.00$                   

#2-49 Koeleria macrantha June Grass 48 720.00$                 No Bid 600.00$                     816.00$                                   No Bid 540.00$                

#2-50 Liatris aspera Button Blazing Star 144 5,760.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#2-51 Lobelia spicata Pale Spiked Lobelia 2 100.00$                 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#2-52 Lolium multiflorum Annual Rye Grass 12800 No Bid No Bid 640.00$                     No Bid No Bid 1,280.00$             

#2-53 Monarda fistulosa Wild Bergamot 48 No Bid 240.00$                         196.80$                     600.00$                                   No Bid 576.00$                

#2-54 Oenothera pilosella Prairie Sundrops 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 282.00$                         No Bid

#2-55 Panicum virgatum Switch Grass 240 No Bid 151.20$                         156.00$                     No Bid 120.00$                         144.00$                

#2-56 Parthenium integrifolium Wild Quinine 192 No Bid 2,160.00$                      No Bid No Bid 3,072.00$                      No Bid

#2-57 Pedicularis canadensis Wood Betony 64 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5,952.00$             

#2-58 Penstemon digitalis Foxglove Beardtongue 24 360.00$                 No Bid 98.40$                       216.00$                                   144.00$                         132.00$                

#2-59 Phlox pilosa Prairie Phlox 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#2-60 Pycnanthemum tenuifolium Slender Mountain Mint 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#2-61 Pycnanthemum virginianum Mountain Mint 5 150.00$                 93.75$                            109.50$                     150.00$                                   225.00$                         85.00$                   

#2-62 Ratibida pinnata Yellow Coneflower 96 No Bid No Bid 134.40$                     360.00$                                   360.00$                         288.00$                

#2-63 Rosa carolina Pasture Rose 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#2-64 Rudbeckia hirta Black-eyed Susan 160 No Bid 150.40$                         96.00$                       320.00$                                   No Bid No Bid

#2-65 Rudbeckia subtomentosa Sweet Black-eyed Susan 32 160.00$                 249.92$                         160.00$                     512.00$                                   179.20$                         160.00$                

#2-66 Rudbeckia triloba Brown-eyed Susan 32 No Bid 80.00$                            48.00$                       352.00$                                   No Bid No Bid

#2-67 Schizachyrium scoparium Little Bluestem 1600 No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,400.00$                                2,800.00$                      1,360.00$             

#2-68 Silene regia Royal Catchfly 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid 84.00$                                     No Bid No Bid



#2-69 Silphium integrifolium Rosin Weed 384 No Bid No Bid 3,110.40$                 No Bid No Bid 10,752.00$           

#2-70 Silphium laciniatum Compass Plant 96 720.00$                 No Bid 960.00$                     No Bid 2,688.00$                      No Bid

#2-71 Silphium terebinthinaceum Prairie Dock 192 1,440.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid 4,032.00$                      1,296.00$             

#2-72 Sisyrinchium albidum Common Blue-Eyed Grass 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#2-73 Solidago gigantea Late Goldenrod 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 374.40$                         No Bid

#2-74 Solidago juncea Early Goldenrod 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid 120.00$                                   84.00$                           108.00$                

#2-75 Solidago speciosa Showy Goldenrod 16 960.00$                 No Bid 214.40$                     No Bid 704.00$                         384.00$                

#2-76 Sorghastrum nutans Indian Grass 240 240.00$                 No Bid 132.00$                     No Bid 132.00$                         96.00$                   

#2-77 Spartina pectinata Cord Grass 48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 768.00$                         No Bid

#2-78 Sporobolus heterolepsis Prairie Dropseed 800 No Bid No Bid 7,280.00$                 No Bid No Bid 7,400.00$             

#2-79 Symphyotrichum ericoides Heath Aster 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 244.00$                         No Bid

#2-80 Symphyotrichum laeve Smooth Blue Aster 32 No Bid No Bid 300.80$                     600.00$                                   352.00$                         296.00$                

#2-81 Symphyotrichum lanceolatum Panicled Aster 4 200.00$                 No Bid No Bid 176.00$                                   112.00$                         160.00$                

#2-82 Symphyotrichum novae-angliae New England Aster 48 480.00$                 No Bid 820.80$                     1,800.00$                                960.00$                         540.00$                

#2-83 Symphyotrichum oblongifolium Aromatic Aster 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#2-84 Symphyotrichum oolentangiense Sky Blue Aster 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid 300.00$                                   100.00$                         No Bid

#2-85 Symphyotrichum puniceum Bristly Aster 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid 440.00$                                   No Bid 384.00$                

#2-86 Taenidia integerrima Yellow Pimpernel 48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#2-87 Tradescantia ohiensis Ohio Spiderwort 192 No Bid No Bid 3,004.80$                 4,320.00$                                No Bid 2,592.00$             

#2-88 Verbena stricta Hoary Vervain 16 96.00$                    No Bid 65.60$                       120.00$                                   No Bid 88.00$                   

#2-89 Vernonia fasciculata Common Ironweed 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid 72.00$                                     37.20$                           No Bid

#2-90 Veronicastrum virginicum Culver’s Root 5 160.00$                 No Bid 187.50$                     375.00$                                   310.00$                         240.00$                

#2-91 Zizia aptera Heart-leaved Golden Alexanders 16 No Bid No Bid 214.40$                     No Bid No Bid No Bid

#2-92 Zizia aurea Golden Alexanders 96 No Bid 240.00$                         211.20$                     No Bid 480.00$                         720.00$                




