

## ABSTRACT OF BIDS

### HERBICIDE CONTROL REED CANARY GRASS SEVEN (7) FOREST PRESERVES

SB-FP-10-2021

7-Jan-21

<b>Bidders Name</b>	<b>Applied Ecological Services, Inc.</b>	<b>V3 Companies, Ltd.</b>	<b>Encap, Inc.</b>	<b>DBI Services, LLC</b>
<b>Address</b>	<b>Brodhead, WI</b>	<b>Woodridge, IL</b>	<b>DeKalb, IL</b>	<b>Decatur, IL</b>
<b>#1. - 20.9 Acres of Aurora West</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$5,445.00</b>	<b>\$14,630.00</b>	<b>\$12,026.28</b>
<b>#2. - 8.8 Acres of Grunwald</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$2,415.00</b>	<b>\$4,840.00</b>	<b>\$5,063.70</b>
<b>#3. - 16.1 Acres of Fox River Shores</b>	<b>\$5,026.00</b>	<b>\$3,360.00</b>	<b>\$7,406.00</b>	<b>\$9,264.27</b>
<b>#4. - 5.4 Acres of Lone Grove</b>	<b>\$1,820.00</b>	<b>\$1,470.00</b>	<b>\$2,241.00</b>	<b>\$3,107.27</b>
<b>#5. - 42.3 Acres of Freeman Kame</b>	<b>\$12,934.00</b>	<b>\$10,395.00</b>	<b>\$17,977.50</b>	<b>\$24,340.27</b>
<b>#6. - 33.4 Acres of Meissner-Corron</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$6,633.00</b>	<b>\$12,692.00</b>	<b>\$19,219.03</b>
<b># 7. - 39 Acres of Pingree Grove</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$11,583.00</b>	<b>\$27,300.00</b>	<b>\$22,441.38</b>
<b>Bidders Name</b>	<b>Integrated Lakes Management</b>	<b>Cardno, Inc.</b>	<b>Woods To Wetlands, LLC</b>	
<b>Address</b>	<b>Waukegan, IL</b>	<b>Monee, IL</b>	<b>Streamwood, IL</b>	
<b>#1 - 20.9 Acres of Aurora West</b>	<b>\$7,144.00</b>	<b>\$7,400.00</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	
<b>#2. - 8.8 Acres of Grunwald</b>	<b>\$2,960.00</b>	<b>\$3,400.00</b>	<b>\$5,000.00</b>	
<b>#3. - 16.1 Acres of Fox River Shores</b>	<b>\$6,043.60</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$5,725.00</b>	
<b>#4. - 5.4 Acres of Lone Grove</b>	<b>\$1,890.80</b>	<b>\$1,900.00</b>	<b>\$1,800.00</b>	
<b>#5. - 42.3 Acres of Freeman Kame</b>	<b>\$15,488.00</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	
<b>#6. - 33.4 Acres of Meissner-Corron</b>	<b>\$8,819.20</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	
<b>#7. - 39 Acres of Pingree Grove</b>	<b>\$14,244.00</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	

I have certified that I have opened, read and recorded all bids received in response to the invitation.

