

ABSTRACT OF BIDS

HERBICIDE CONTROL OF WOODY RE-SPROUTS

HERBICIDE CONTROL OF WOODY RE-SPROUTS

SB-FP-04-2122

Sent to 29 Vendors Received 5

Bidders Name	Encap, Inc.	Woods to Wetlands, LLC	Tallgrass Restoration, LLC.	Cardno, Inc.	Integrated Lakes Management, Inc.
Address	DeKalb, IL	Streamwood, IL	Schaumburg, IL	Monee, IL	Waukegan, IL
PROJECT 1. 49 acres Helm Woods Forest Preserve, Barrington Hills, IL	\$30,625.00	\$14,825.00	\$18,375.00	\$18,330.00	\$20,663.60
Project 2. 40 acres Lone Grove Forest Preserve, Maple Park, IL	\$15,800.00	No Bid	\$23,200.00	No Bid	\$19,675.55
Project 3. 35 acres Freeman Kame Forest Preserve, Gilberts, IL	\$18,900.00	No Bid	\$13,440.00	\$15,271.00	\$24,254.40
Project 4. 13 acres Pingree Grove Forest Preserve, Hampshire, IL	\$5,395.00	\$3,840.00	\$4,940.00	No Bid	\$5,314.40

I have certified that I have opened, read and recorded all bids received in response to the invitation.



Kenneth Stanish, Chief Financial Officer