

ABSTRACT OF BIDS

HERBICIDE WEED MANAGEMENT AT FOUR PRESERVES

						17-Oct-19	
SB-FP-19-1920						Sent to 25 Vendors 6 Rec'd	
Bidders Name	Integrated Lakes Management, Inc.	Semper Fi Land Services, Inc.	Applied Ecological Services, Inc.	Tallgrass Restoration, LLC.	V3 Companies, Ltd.	McGinty Bros., Inc.	
Address	Waukegan, IL	Yorkville, IL	Brodhead, WI	Schaumburg, IL	Woodridge, IL	Long Grove, IL	
Project #1 - 52 acres of Freeman Kame	\$26,900.00	\$21,860.00	no bid	\$25,074.50	\$30,729.50	\$13,104.00	
Project #2 - 37 acres of Freeman Kame	\$11,825.00	\$15,250.00	\$13,483.00	\$17,799.50	no bid	\$11,620.00	
Project #3 - 52 acres of Helm Woods	\$22,000.00	\$21,860.00	\$19,641.00	\$17,508.40	\$30,729.50	\$14,200.00	
Project #4 - 40 acres of Helm Woods	\$21,450.00	\$16,275.00	no bid	\$21,172.80	\$22,815.00	\$13,600.00	
Project #5 - 19 acres of Meissner-Corron	\$6,000.00	\$8,650.00	\$6,516.00	\$11,616.00	no bid	no bid	
Project #6 - 49 acres of Dick Young	\$19,395.00	\$16,600.00	no bid	\$27,264.60	no bid	\$14,600.00	
Project #7 - 16 acres of Dick Young	\$3,230.00	\$5,200.00	no bid	\$9,032.10	no bid	\$5,800.00	

I have certified that I have opened, read and recorded all bids received in response to the invitation.


Kenneth Stanish, Chief Financial Officer