

ABSTRACT OF BIDS Reed Canary Grass Management

SB-FP-08-2223

Sent to Vendors 32, Responding 3

Bidders Name	Integrated Lakes Management, Inc.	Woods to Wetlands, LLC	RES Great Lakes, LLC
Address	Waukegan, IL	Streamwood, IL	Brodhead, WI
Project 1. - 51 acres Dick Young Forest Preserve, Batavia, IL	\$18,900.00	NO BID	NO BID
Project 2. - 22.3 acres of Aurora West Forest Preserve, Aurora, IL	\$9,560.00	NO BID	NO BID
Project 3. - 5.2 acres Braeburn Marsh Forest Preserve, Batavia, IL	\$2,395.00	\$2,370.00	NO BID
Project 4. - 47.4 acres of Freeman Kame Forest Preserve, Gilberts, IL	\$29,700.00	NO BID	\$17,400.00
Project 5. - 9 acres of Grunwald Forest Preserve, Elburn, IL	\$3,870.00	NO BID	NO BID
Project 6. - 32.1 acres of Hannaford Woods Forest Preserve, Sugar Grove, IL	\$20,500.00	NO BID	NO BID
Project 7. - 5.8 acres of Lone Grove Forest Preserve, Elburn, IL	\$2,580.00	\$2,578.00	NO BID
Project 8. - 27.3 acres of Fox River Shores Forest Preserve, Carpentersville, IL	\$20,425.00	NO BID	\$10,800.00
Project 9. - 24.8 acres of Meissner-Corrton Forest Preserve, St. Charles, IL	\$14,570.00	NO BID	\$9,900.00
Project 10. - 27.2 acres of Pingree Grove Forest Preserve, Pingree Grove, IL	\$21,850.00	NO BID	\$10,600.00
Project 11. - 5.7 acres of Rutland Forest Preserve, Elburn, IL	\$5,230.00	\$2,495.00	\$4,300.00

I have certified that I have opened, read and recorded all bids received in response to the invitation.


David Petschke, Chief Financial Officer