

ABSTRACT OF BIDS

REED CANARY CONTROL SB-FP-23-1920	22-Jan-20 Sent to 23 Vendors, Received 6					
Bidders Name:	Cardno , Inc.	Woods to Wetlands, LLC	Integrated Lakes Management	Applied Ecological Services, Inc.	McGinty Bros., Inc.	Semper Fi Land Services, Inc.
Address	Monee, IL	Streamwood, IL	Waukegan, IL	Brodhead, WI	Long Grove, IL	Yorkville, IL
PROJECT 1. 4.5 ACRES OF BRAEBURN MARSH	\$3,000.00	\$2,345.00	\$1,600.00	No Bid	\$2,070.00	No Bid
PROJECT 2. 36 ACRES OF DICK YOUNG	\$12,600.00	\$7,630.00	\$5,700.00	\$7,371.00	\$10,440.00	\$7,995.00
PROJECT 3. 16 ACRES OF FOX RIVER SHORES	No Bid	\$6,000.00	\$14,200.00	No Bid	\$7,184.00	\$6,360.00
PROJECT 4. 5.4 ACRES OF LONE GROVE	\$3,500.00	\$2,690.00	\$9,300.00	\$1,931.00	\$3,726.00	No Bid
PROJECT 5. 42. ACRES OF FREEMAN KAME	No Bid	No Bid	\$16,300.00	\$13,409.00	\$18,438.00	\$14,725.00
PROJECT 6. 33.4 ACRES OF MEISSNER-CORRON	No Bid	No Bid	\$9,725.00	\$11,057.00	\$22,712.00	\$11,850.00

I have certified that I have opened, read and recorded all bids received in response to the invitation.


Kenneth Stanish, Chief Financial Officer