

ABSTRACT OF BIDS

SB-FP-02-2324

TREE & BRUSH REMOVAL FOR SIX (6) FOREST PRESERVES

Sent to 33 Vendors, 9 Responding

Bidders Name	Pizzo & Associates, Ltd.	Central Tree & Landscape Mulch, LLC	Encap, Inc.	McGinty Bros., Inc.	Homer Tree Service, Inc.	Integrated Lakes Management	Trees "R" Us, Inc.	HGS, LLC dba RES Environmental Operating Company	Bluestem Ecological Services
City, State	Leland, IL	Pingree Grove, IL	Dekalb, WI	Long Grove, IL	Lockport, IL	Waukegan, IL	Ingleside, IL	Chicago, IL	Marengo, IL
Project 1. 49.7 acres Hampshire Forest Preserve, Hampshire, IL	\$109,340.00	\$123,500.00	\$144,130.00	\$249,870.00	\$238,560.00	No bid	\$237,436.00	\$214,100.00	No bid
Project 2. 26.4 acres Hampshire Forest Preserve, Hampshire, IL	\$58,080.00	\$51,480.00	\$69,960.00	\$185,250.00	\$126,720.00	No bid	\$131,680.00	\$114,900.00	\$176,200.00
Project 3. 12.2 acres Burnidge Forest Preserve, Elgin, IL	\$53,680.00	\$33,245.00	\$35,380.00	No bid	\$58,560.00	\$148,410.00	\$63,480.00	\$57,300.00	\$96,000.00
Project 4. 25 acres Burnidge Forest Preserve, Elgin, IL	\$110,000.00	\$59,000.00	\$72,500.00	No bid	\$120,000.00	\$294,350.00	\$121,635.00	\$113,800.00	No bid
Project 5. 12.8 acres of Grunwald Forest Preserve, Elburn, IL	\$42,240.00	\$36,480.00	\$30,720.00	\$90,025.00	\$61,440.00	\$70,656.00	\$64,285.00	No Bid	No bid
Project 6. 9.8 acres Grunwald Forest Preserve, Elburn, IL	\$32,340.00	\$27,930.00	\$25,235.00	\$53,250.00	\$47,040.00	\$49,970.00	\$48,392.00	No Bid	No bid

I have certified that I have opened, read and recorded all bids received in response to the invitation.


 David Petschke, Chief Financial Officer