
Forest Preserve Planning & Utilization Committee Agenda Memo 

ABSTRACT OF BIDS 

SB-FP-02-2122 

TREE & BRUSH CLEARING OF SEVEN (7) PROJECTS 

Central Tree & Pizzo& Integrated Lakes Davey Resource 
Bidders Name McGinty Bros., Inc. Encap, Inc. 

Landscape Mulch, LLC Associates, LTD. Management Group, Inc. 

Address Long Grove, IL DeKalb, IL Hoffman Estates, IL Leland, IL Waukegan, IL Elmhurst, IL 

Project 1 - 13.5 Acres Freeman 
No Bid $57,375.00 $55,450.00 No Bid No Bid $65,210.00 

Kame Forest Preserve 

Project 2 - 25.1 Acres Burnidge 
No Bid $46,435.00 $49,945.00 No Bid No Bid $140,200.50 

Forest Preserve 

Project 3 - 11.3 Acres Arlene 
$32,440.00 $18,645.00 $14,945.00 $22,600.00 $68,881.59 $64,980.00 

Shoemaker Forest Preserve 

Project 4 - 78.4 Acres Fabyan 
No Bid $156,800.00 $171,472.00 No Bid No Bid $392,050.00 

Forest Preserve 

Project 5 - 29 Acres Fabyan Forest 
No Bid $88,450.00 $89,388.00 No Bid No Bid $145,790.00 

Preserve 

Project 6 - 19.5 Acres Fabyan 
$120,600.00 $43,875.00 $46,800.00 $43,115.00 No Bid $100,280.00 

Forest Preserve 

Project 7 - 6.9 Acres Fabyan Forest 
$25,560.00 $13,110.00 $17,150.00 No Bid No Bid $38,592.00 

Preserve 

I have certified that I have opened, read and recorded all bids received in response to the invitation. 

�� 
Kenneth Stanish - Chief Financial Officer 

Sent to 28 Vendors 6 responding


