

ABSTRACT OF BIDS

Sent to Vendors 33, 6 Responding

SB-FP-01-2223

TREE & BRUSH REMOVAL FOR TEN (10) FOREST PRESERVES

Bidders Name	Encap, Inc.	Central Tree & Landscape Mulch, LLC	RES Great Lakes, LLC	McGinty Bros., Inc.	Homer Tree Service, Inc.	Integrated Lakes Management, Inc.
Address	DeKalb, IL	Pingree Grove, IL	Brodhead, WI	Long Grove, IL	Lockport, IL	Waukegan, IL
Project 1. 25.5 acres Burnidge FP	\$79,050.00	\$52,450.00	\$60,300.00	\$83,850.00	\$204,000.00	\$106,500.00
Project 2. 12 acres Burnidge FP	\$37,800.00	\$24,750.00	\$35,700.00	\$44,400.00	\$96,000.00	\$44,875.00
Project 3. 10.1 acres Grunwald Farms FP	\$24,745.00	\$26,000.00	\$30,800.00	No Bid	\$80,800.00	\$47,485.00
Project 4. 10.1 acres Grunwald Farms FP	\$24,745.00	\$26,000.00	\$30,800.00	No Bid	\$80,800.00	\$41,695.00
Project 5. 22.1 acres Big Rock Forest Preserve	\$43,647.50	\$49,700.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$176,800.00	\$106,429.00
Project 6. 22 acres Big Rock Forest Preserve	\$45,650.00	\$54,648.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$176,000.00	\$76,150.00
Project 7. 28 acres Big Rock Forest Preserve	\$69,300.00	\$80,934.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$224,000.00	\$112,880.00
Project 8. 25.1 acres Big Rock Forest Preserve	\$46,435.00	\$66,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$200,800.00	\$99,915.00
Project 9. 43.4 acres BiG Rock Forest Preserve	\$139,965.00	\$108,450.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$347,200.00	\$231,445.00
Project 10. 29.2 acres in the Hoschiet Woods Forest Preserve	\$52,268.00	\$33,000.00	\$46,000.00	\$59,430.00	\$233,600.00	\$40,360.00

I have certified that I have opened, read and recorded all bids received in response to the invitation.



Kenneth Stanish, Chief Financial Officer