

ABSTRACT OF BIDS

TREE & BRUSH REMOVAL FOR SIX (6) FOREST PRESERVES

Sent to 37 Vendors, 11 Responding

Bidder's Name	HGS, LLC DBA RES Environmental Operating Company, LLC	V3 Construction Company	Semper Fi Land Services, Inc.	Central Tree & Landscape Mulch, LLC	Encap, Inc.	McGinty Bros., Inc.	Integrated Lakes Management	Clean Cut Tree Service, Inc.	Cardinal State, LLC	Pizzo & Associates LTD.	Bluestem Ecological Services, Inc.
City, State	Chicago, IL	Woodridge, IL	Yorkville, IL	Pingree Grove, IL	Dekalb, IL	Long Grove, IL	Waukegan, IL	Grayslake, IL	Barrington Hills, IL	Leland, IL	Marengo, IL
Project 1. Tree & Brush Cutting 94.6 acres of Dick Young Forest Preserve, Batavia , IL.	\$48,435.20	\$59,000.00	\$77,897.28	\$139,975.00	\$170,280.00	\$178,000.00	\$111,468.00	\$151,360.00	\$141,845.00	\$127,700.00	No Bid
Project 2. Tree & Brush Cutting 52 acres of Pingree Grove Forest Preserve, Pingree Grove, IL	\$29,848.00	\$64,440.00	\$53,017.60	\$65,950.00	\$93,600.00	\$117,335.00	\$56,068.00	\$109,200.00	No Bid	\$81,980.00	\$40,309.00
Project 3. Tree & Brush Cutting 45.7 acres of Hannaford Woods Forest Preserve, Sugar Grove, IL	\$24,860.80	\$22,950.00	\$47,816.32	\$65,990.00	\$82,260.00	\$104,770.00	\$49,340.00	\$105,110.00	\$71,760.00	\$59,940.00	No Bid
Project 4. Tree & Brush Cutting 41.6 acres of Bliss Woods Forest Preserve, Sugar Grove, IL	\$170,476.80	\$257,465.00	\$48,312.32	\$82,975.00	\$106,080.00	\$330,125.00	\$73,622.00	\$184,288.00	\$103,990.00	\$101,160.00	No Bid
Project 5. Tree & Brush Cutting 5.9 acres of Bliss Woods Forest Preserve, Sugar Grove, IL	\$26,992.50	\$52,675.00	\$8,236.16	\$15,885.00	\$15,635.00	\$61,750.00	\$15,422.00	\$25,016.00	\$21,185.00	\$19,980.00	No Bid
Project 6. Tree & Brush Cutting 8.5 acres of Bliss Woods Forest Preserve, Sugar Grove, IL	\$40,077.50	\$56,475.00	\$15,264.96	\$19,975.00	\$23,375.00	\$88,620.00	\$24,280.00	\$36,040.00	\$28,565.00	\$22,980.00	No Bid

I have certified that I have opened, read and recorded all bids received in response to the invitation.



David Petschke, Chief Financial Officer