Forest Preserve Planning & Utilization Committee Agenda Memo

| | 10-Jan-20
SB-FP-20-1819 Vegetation Inventory Sent to 38 Vendors, 10 Responding
Integrated | Environmental Tallgrass Applied Crawford, Orbis Weaver
Bidders Name Lakes Consulting & | Restoration, Ecological Murphy & Huft and Encap, Inc. | Environmental GrafTree | Consultants
Management |Technology, Inc. LLC. Services, Inc. | Tilly, Inc. Huff, Inc. Consulting Care, Inc. (Group North
Central, LLC.
Address Waukegan, IL| Lombard, IL SchauITburg, west Il)imdee, Aurora, IL Oak :‘Y aok, DeKalb, IL | South Bend, IN | Batavia, IL |Naperville, IL
Option #1 - 15.6 acres of Almon Underwood $1,125.00 NO BID $1,855.00 $2,025.00 $2,000.00 | $5,700.00 | $1,975.00 $3,100.00 $3,135.00 $5,570.00
Option #2 - 37.9 acres of Bliss Woods $3,000.00 $3,150.00 $3,648.00 $2,495.00 $3,600.00 | $6,000.00 | $3,500.00 $3,950.00 $3,540.00 $7,060.00
Option #3 - 117.9 acres of Bliss Woods $5,625.00 NO BID NO BID $3,100.00 $6,600.00 | $6,600.00 | $7,600.00 $9,000.00 $9,481.00 NO BID
Option #4 - 88.8 acres of Johnson Mound $4,500.00 $3,450.00 NO BID $2,395.00 $5,000.00 | $6,100.00 | $4,150.00 $6,490.00 $7,527.00 NO BID
Option #5 - 30.4 acres of Burlington Prairie $4,500.00 NO 8ID $3,050.00 $2,560.00 $4,200.00 | $5,100.00 | $2,350.00 $3,950.00 $4,277.00 $7,155.00
Option #6 - 134 acres of Pingree Grove $13,500.00 NO BID NO BID $2,775.00 $9,000.00 | $7,100.00 | $8,700.00 $9,900.00 $8,277.00 NO BID
Option #7 - 75.6 acres of Burnidge $7,500.00 NO BID NO BID $2,275.00 $6,000.00 T $6,100.00 | $5,600.00 $6,190.00 $7,145.00 NO BID
Bption #8 - 44.2 acres of Big Rock $4,950.00 $3,450.00 $4,370.00 $2,825.00 $5,000.00 | $6,100.00 | $2,300.00 $6,170.00 $7,820.00 NO BID
Option #9 - 23.1 acres of Lone Grove $1,350.00 $3,150.00 $2,455.00 $2,300.00 $5,000.00 | $4,500.00 @ $1,850.00 $2,775.00 NO BID $6,105.00
Option #10 - 2.7 acres of McLean Road Fen $525.00 NO BID $960.00 $1,500.00 $2,000.00 | $3,100.00 | $1,450.00 $2,400.00 NO BID $3,445.00
Option #11 - 47.3 acres of Schweitzer Woods - $3,750.00 NO BID $4,313.00 $2,100.00 $5,000.00 | $5,700.00 | $4,200.00 $3,900.00 $5,777.00 | NOBID
Option #12 - 29.3 acres of Arlene Shoemaker $2,250.00 $3,150.00 $3,635.00 $2,675.00 | $5,200.00 | $4,700.00 | $2,050.00 | $5,190.00 | $3,837.00 | $6,800.00
Option #13 - 21.2 acres of Sauer Family Prairie $1,350.00 NO BID ] $2,425.00 $1,935.00 $4,400.00 | $5,600.00 | $1,425.00 $2,950.00 NO BID $5,960.00
Option #14 - 95.4 acres of Dick Young $5,250.00 $2,150.00 NO BID $3,715.00 NO BID ‘ $7,700.00 | $9,000.00 $6,000.00 NC;-BID NO BID

Ifm;rtiﬁed that | have opened, read and recorded all bids received in response to the invitation.

/'_-/’

Kenneth Stanish, Chief Financial Officer




