

ABSTRACT OF BIDS

SB-FP-14-2021 Vegetation Inventory											Sent to 45 Vendors, 11 Responded	
Bidders Name	Integrated Lakes Management	Orbis Environmental Consulting, LLC	Tallgrass Restoration, LLC	Applied Ecological Services, Inc.	Crawford, Murphy & Tilly, Inc.	Woods to Wetlands, LLC	Encap, Inc.	Environmental Consulting & Technology, Inc.	Huff and Huff, Inc., a subsidiary of GZA	Jeo Consulting Group, Inc.	Davey Resource Group, Inc.	
Address	Waukegan, IL	South Bend, IN	Schaumburg, IL	Brodhead, WI	Aurora, IL	Streamwood, IL	DeKalb, IL	Lombard, IL	Oak Brook, IL	Ankeny, IA	Elmhurst, IL	
Option #1 - 11.4 acres of Sleepy Hollow FP	\$900.00	\$2,300.00	\$1,683.20	\$2,250.00	\$1,035.00	\$875.00	\$2,675.00	\$2,050.00	\$1,500.00	\$825.00	\$7,765.00	
Option #2 - 37.1 acres of Rutland FP	\$2,800.00	\$3,650.00	\$2,778.40	\$2,750.00	\$1,840.00	\$2,925.00	\$3,400.00	\$4,200.00	\$3,100.00	\$1,225.00	\$7,765.00	
Option #3 - 39.1 acres of Hampshire FP	\$2,950.00	\$3,100.00	\$2,218.60	\$2,750.00	\$1,840.00	\$2,190.00	\$2,200.00	\$3,850.00	No Bid	\$1,275.00	\$7,765.00	
Option #4 - 46.7 acres of John Duerr FP	\$2,350.00	\$3,750.00	\$1,834.10	\$2,950.00	\$2,530.00	\$2,560.00	\$3,300.00	\$3,250.00	No Bid	\$1,450.00	\$7,895.00	
Option #5 - 64.2 acres of Elburn FP	\$3,250.00	\$4,775.00	\$2,934.00	\$3,300.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,225.00	\$2,400.00	No Bid	\$1,725.00	\$12,335.00	
Option #6 - 33.1 acres of Dick Young FP	\$1,700.00	\$3,200.00	\$1,539.30	\$3,350.00	\$1,840.00	\$1,995.00	\$2,700.00	\$2,650.00	No Bid	\$1,200.00	\$7,895.00	
Option #7 - 44.8 acres of Fabyan FP	\$2,300.00	\$3,600.00	\$2,943.80	\$3,000.00	\$2,530.00	\$2,860.00	\$3,300.00	\$3,700.00	\$2,800.00	\$1,450.00	\$7,895.00	
Option #8 - 84.4 acres of Oakhurst FP	\$4,250.00	\$5,300.00	\$3,864.80	\$3,890.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$3,200.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,100.00	\$12,595.00	
Option #9 - 42 acres of Blackberry Maples FP	\$3,150.00	\$3,000.00	\$3,120.00	\$3,750.00	\$2,530.00	\$2,490.00	\$1,800.00	\$2,400.00	No Bid	\$1,400.00	\$8,290.00	
Option #10 - 8.6 acres of Grunwald FP	\$860.00	\$2,140.00	\$1,527.00	\$3,000.00	\$1,035.00	\$800.00	\$1,315.00	\$2,100.00	No Bid	\$750.00	\$5,415.00	
Option #11 - 42 acres of LeRoy Oakes FP	\$3,150.00	\$3,100.00	\$2,688.00	\$3,350.00	\$2,530.00	\$2,280.00	\$2,700.00	\$3,250.00	No Bid	\$1,400.00	\$8,290.00	
Option #12 - 36.3 acres of Raceway Woods FP	\$3,615.00	\$3,000.00	\$1,716.80	\$2,500.00	No Bid	\$1,995.00	\$3,400.00	\$3,700.00	No Bid	\$1,250.00	\$7,375.00	
Option #13 - 34.4 acres of Antos FP	\$2,150.00	\$3,000.00	\$1,734.60	\$3,400.00	No Bid	\$2,095.00	\$1,735.00	\$2,450.00	No Bid	\$1,200.00	\$7,375.00	
Option #14 - 80.2 acres of Needham Woods FP	\$4,000.00	\$5,500.00	\$3,998.60	\$3,750.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,375.00	\$3,100.00	No Bid	\$2,000.00	\$14,545.00	

I have certified that I have opened, read and recorded all bids received in response to the invitation.



Kenneth Stanish, Chief Financial Officer